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FOREWORD

SIMON KUZNETS
Chairman,
Universities-National Bureau
Committee for Economic Research

I

In deciding to devote one of its conferences to a discussion of research in
business finance, the Universities-National Bureau CommitLee was guided
by certain convictions: that important investigation in this field has de-
,veloped along several lines in recent years; that men actively engaged in
such investigation would both welcome and profit from an opportunity to
set their conclusions down on paper and throw them open to discussion;
and that from such concerted exploration would emerge a clearer view of
the field and of the limits of our knowledge, as well as a sharpened sense
of direction for future work. The soundness of these convictions was con-
firmed by the willingness with which scholars in the field accepted the task
of preparing papers or comments when invited to do so; by their readiness
to participate in the conference through the three days, June 19-21, 1950,
over which it was held; and by the efforts many subsequently made to
revise their papers and comments for publication.

That the conference was as successful as it was, and that it yielded a
gratifying return — both tangible in the papers and discussion assembled
in this volume and intangible in the intellectual sparks that were struck in
the meetings — was, in large part, due to the Planning Committee in
charge. This Committee, of which C. R. Whittlesey was chairman, R. J.
Saulnier, secretary, and James S. Barley, Irwin Friend, and Albert R.
Koch (serving for Ralph A. Young) were members, labored for two years
prior to the conference. It mapped out the field, formulated topics for the
papers, found the scholars competent and ready to prepare them, selected
and invited the discussants, set the time sequence and the general mechan-
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viii RESEARCH IN BUSINESS FINANCE

ics of the meeting, and, finally, chose the participants, other than authors
and discussants, to be invited. The heaviest burden fell, as it always does,
upon the shoulders of the chairman and secretary; and the latter, in par-
ticular, had to assume the major responsibility also for preparing the com-
pilation for the press. Readers of this volume, which should be of interest
to everyone concerned with the way in which a business economy oper-
ates, owe a large debt not only to the authors and the discussants but also
to the Planning Committee; and in this pleasant debt the Universities-
National Bureau Committee gratefully acknowledges its own substantial
share.

II

The broad area covered in the conference, and detailed in the papers and
discussion that follow, is briefly and effectively reviewed by Irwin Friend
in his Summary and Appraisal. The reader who would like to orient him-
self in the volume might first read this summary, and with the over-all
view thus secured turn to the individual papers and comments.

It would be presumptuous for one who is relatively unfamiliar with
the field to attempt to add either to the discussion or to Mr. Friend's sum-
mary. But it may be useful to preface these with the impressions of an
interested outsider.

The papers presented at the conference fell into several groups. The
first dealt with the broad statistical framework of sources and uses of funds
of American business; the several papers combined represented an attempt
to indicate what we know, and what we still have to learn regarding the
flow of funds through business firms. The authors raised pertinent ques-
tions and attempted a summary of available information not only for
American nonfinancial corporate business in the aggregate, but also for
important sectors — by industry, by size of firm, and for new vs. estab-
lished firms. In this group were the papers by Messrs. McHugh, Schmidt,
and Bridge, included in the present volume, and a discussion by Sidney
Alexander of sources and uses of business funds prior to 1926, which
unfortunately was not available for inclusion.

The second group of papers included a collaborative effort by Messrs.
Hoover and Klein and a related paper by Mr. Koch covering the general
problem of projecting business capital requirements. The Hoover-Klein
paper appraises. the relative usefulness of various methods of estimating
future capital requirements, whereas Koch attempts in his paper to project
requirements for all manufacturing corporations over a five-year period.
The two papers which follow constitute a more or less distinct group: both
treat the problem of capital demand from a nonquantitative viewpoint
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and are principally concerned with the motivational aspects of user and
investor decisions with respect to capital use. The joint paper by Messrs.
Jacoby and Weston analyzes the various factors that influence manage-
ments in determining the form in which capital funds will be sought in the
markets, while Mr. Jones's paper explores the motivations of investors in

how they will hold their assets and the effects of such deci-
sions on corporate financial structure.

The final set of papers, by Mr. Durand and Messrs. Modigliani and
Zeman, presents theoretical analyses, supported by certain empirical tests,
of the relationship between business demaiid for capital funds and the
costs of obtaining these fuhds. In this instance the authors are not attempt-
ing to measure the volume of funds required or utilized, but rather to
increase our understanding of the effect that changes in the terms on which
funds are available have on the decisions of would-be users.

This brief description of the scope of the conference papers and dis-
cussion should be sufficient to indicate that no definitive answer could be
given to many of the challenging questions. The stock of statistical .data
available for research in the field of business finance is still rather scanty,
and notably poorer than that in several other fields whichhave been in the
forefront of public attention for a longer time. As a result, estimates of
aggregates and components can be made for only a few years, and even
these are not without exceptions for unincorporated enterprises, and pres-
ent major difficulties even for corporations. For obvious reasons, tested
observations and records of the kind that would penetrate inside the busi-
ness firm and reveal the factors that made for decisions in crucial test cases
(situations differing with respect to the demand for, and supply of, funds)
are still an object of hope rather than of accomplishment. One is therefore
not surprised to find in the papers and in the discussion a strong under-
current of lament over our ignorance and urgent calls for additional data,
analyses, or both.

With such a reaction and such emphasis one can only sympathize. But
it may be pertinent to make some comments which, while obvious to
scholars in the field, might place their difficulties in a broader perspective.

First, accumulation of reliable statistical data, on totals and on com-
ponents, over a period long enough to permit. proper historical perspective
and. distinction between the transient and the relatively invariant, is the
indispensable base of progress. Yet accumulation of such data, over a
sufficiently long period, is a slow process. For deep-seated and far-reach-
ing reasons, the collection o.f fundamental statistics in any society follows
a historical sequence — and data on sources and uses of funds by business
come quite late in that sequence, much later than, say, data on population,
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foreign trade, or manufactures. Even today, information on important
'sectors of fund-using business, e.g., unincorporated enterprises, is lacking;
and systematic collection of it is still a matter of the future. One must,
therefore, expect that a sufficiently long and articulated statistical record
will not be available for years to come.

Second, this does not necessarily mean that the scanty' data
already available should not be analyzed most intensively, or that efforts
could not be made to assure the supply of basic data where they are either
lacking or in danger of neglect. As Mr. Friend points out, there are bodies
of data in the field of which no adequate analysis has as yet been made.
Active and intensive utilization of statistical data for analytical purposes
is a major, and perhaps the only means of assuring that, once society rec-
ognizes a field as sufficiently important to warrant collection of basic statis-
tics, such collection will be adequately guaranteed and so produce the
cumulative results necessary to a proper statistical framework.

Third, when and if such a statistical framework for business finance is
adequately built up, revealing properly the significant components by
industry, age, size, region, etc., and providing a long enough time coverage
to include a variety of historical conditions, a great deal will be learned
about the behavior of business firms in terms of their financial policies —
without entry into the confines of the single firm or the use of interviews,
questionnaires, etc. One sometimes wonders whether recourse to the latter
is not a desperate short cut to significant results — a short cut that seems
attractive, even indispensable, when we lack quantitative data in the field,
and lack accordingly the results of analysis of such data in the past. One
may also wonder whether advocacy of this short cut is always accompanied
by clear realization of the difficulties that arise in testing the results, and
of the extent to which the findings can be construed as valid — not only as
a post hoc description of entrepreneurial decisions and of the reasons
advanced for them, but also as a proper evaluation of those factors, with
weights attached, that govern groups of business firms in their aggregate

Clearly, as far as results are concerned, the approach via the statistical
framework and its analysis, and that via model or interview analysis of
individual firm behavior, are complementary. But like all resource-using
undertakings in this world, they are competitive in that, at least for re-
sources that are mobile, absorption in one approach precludes their use
in another. To this extent there arises a broad question of intellectual
strategy which each investigator will have to answer for himself, within
the conditions in which he is working and according to his understanding
of the major problem. No single and authoritative answer can be given to
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this question. It may be hoped, however, that the discussion in the papers
and comments that follow will have clarified some of the elements in-
volved.

III

Economic research is carried on under conditions in which the investigator
is either tempted or compelled to concern himself with current problems.
This is certainly true of scholars engaged in research under business aus-
pices, since their work must be oriented to the practical problems of their
firms. It is also true of the vast majority of investigators engaged in
research under government auspices — whose analysis must bear close
relation to immediate problems bearing on their particular agency. Even
for academic scholars the temptation to orient their work to issues cur-
rently in the forefront of public discussion is quite strong —
if only from a desire to glean further knowledge from current experience
or to apply what is known to the problems of the day.

From the standpoiiit of the long-term contribution of economic re-
search to a comprehension of underlying processes and to a firm empirical
foundation from which to observe and classify the results of economic and
social interaction, such emphasis on current business problems or public
issues of the day may seem, and in fact is, a diversion that draws resources
away from a continuous building up of scientific conclusions. The atten-
tion paid by the authors in the present volume to problems of small or new
business firms, and to the alleged shortage of equity capital, may be char-
acterized by a captious critic as typical of such diversions, which precipi-
tate claims to conclusions that cannot be founded on sufficient evidence
and raise issues which, however important they may seem today, are likely

• to be out of fashion tomorrow.
But it is idle to imagine that society would be willing to concentrate

all its intellectual resources in a given field on a systematic and continuous
study of the past, sheltered from preoccupation with current problems that
shift from day to day and from research directed at questions of practical
importance to the business firm or government agency. Nor should we
assume that such direction of research to current practical ends is com-
pletely or largely a waste of time from the standpoint of cumulative growth
of objective knowledge. Provided that minimum standards of objectivity
are preserved, and the results made accessible for wider use, with proper
identification of the empirical and of the conjectural, such "practical"
research can add immensely to our knowledge even if we as individuals
are concerned with the eternal verities. To the academic scholar in par-
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ticular, such practical research can contribute insights ordinarily attain-
able only through close familiarity with business or public policy.

From that standpoint the participation in the conference of groups
from academic institutions, from business firms, and from government
agencies, was one of its most valuable features. is in the pooling of
the experience and viewpoints contributed by academic and by practical
research that the greatest promise lies. In the natural sciences, the pioneers
of the dispassionate empirical approach, who were the founders of modern
science and the progenitors of what turned out to be the most immensely
practical project mankind has ever undertaken, learned much from crafts-
men and practitioners who, in their daily work, accumulated a store of
knowledge of the properties of materials and of the more obvious manifes-
tations of natural forces. So also in the building up of the empirical ground-
work of social science, the scholars who are interested in the basic and
persistent forces underlying economic processes can learn a great deal
from those who have to practice economic arts. And it is through such
contacts that the investigators engaged in practical research will in turn be
assisted in raising the standards of objectivity and levels of historical per-
spective that will make their own work more useful practically and their
results, when available, more valuable to the academic scholar.

Iv

It is to be hoped that, necessarily limited as the results of the confer-
ence may seem, they will prove sufficiently useful so that the experiment
will be repeated in the same field of research .in business finance a few
years hence, when a greater body of data and experience has accumulated
and the need for taking another broad look becomes apparent. In such an
event, it is to be hoped that the next conference will also draw, as this one
did, upon scholars in universities, government offices, and research divi-
sions of business firms; that it may, in addition, pay some attention to
experience in other countries for the sake of any additional data or analysis
that such countries, particularly those with a social structure like our own,
may contribute; and that the next conference, like the present, will elicit a
wide and wholehearted response from all active investigators in the field,
and owe its success in large part to a group who will give to its organization
the skill and devotion that were lavished on the present undertaking by its
Planning Committee.
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